No. CC032111-02

BID SUMMARY
March 21, 2011

1. No. CC032111-02.1 — Well No. 8 Pump Replacement Project No. W10-1896 / CIP No. 50832 (Opened
on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $65,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $65,000.00
Base Bid
1. Weston Engineering, Inc.** $54,115.00
2. Layne Christensen Company** $44,728.29

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

2. No. CC032111-02.2 — North Pinedale Reservoir for Good Samaritan Society Project No. W10-1890 /
CIP No. 50832 (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $1,600,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 1,600,000.00
Base Bid
1. Hills Materials Company** $1,687,896.66
2. Heavy Constructors, Inc.** $1,675,840.87
3. Quinn Construction, Inc.** $1,649,308.00
4. Mainline Contracting, Inc.** $1,554,107.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

3. No. CC032111-02.3 — Kepps Water Main Extension Project No. W08-1702 / CIP No. 50625 (Opened
on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $650,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $755,000.00
Base Bid
1. Ladner Excavating & Trenching LLC** $845,215.80
2. Hills Materials Company** $706,711.35
3. Mainline Contracting, Inc.** $1,058,791.45
4. Quinn Construction, Inc.** $899,311.30

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



No. CC032111-02

BID SUMMARY
March 21, 2011

4. No. CC032111-02.4 — Dyess Avenue & Beale Street Overlay Project No. ST09-1826 / CIP No. 50775
(Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $92,200.00
ENGINEER’'S ESTIMATE $90,300.00
Base Bid
1. J & J Asphalt Company** $60,790.00
2. Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.** $82,125.00
3. Hills Materials Company** $63,473.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

5. No. CC032111-02.5 — Rapid Creek Trunk Sewer Manhole Rehabilitation Project No. SS10-1852 / CIP
No. 50194 (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $225,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $299,063.00
Base Bid
1. Mainline Contracting, Inc.** $361,750.00
2. Hills Materials Company** $279,981.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

6. No. CC032111-02.6 — Pavement Marking — Lane Line Painting Project No. PM11-1934 / CIP No.
50594 (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $61,050.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $61,005.00
Base Bid
1. Dakota Barricade, LLC* $64,455.00
2. Traffic Services Company, LLC** $81,232.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



No. CC032111-02

BID SUMMARY
March 21, 2011

7. No. CC032111-02.7 — Tandem Roll-Off Truck, Solid Waste Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $140,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE
Base Bid

1. Eddies Truck Sales** $139,377.06
2. Eddies Truck Sales** $141,248.00
3. Eddies Truck Sales** $136,377.06
4. Eddies Truck Sales** $138,560.00
5. Sheehan Mack Sales** $159,685.00
6. Boyer Ford Truck Sales* $158,897.00
7. Boyer Ford Truck Sales (otprovided) $161,080.00
8. Sanitation Products* $155,438.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

8. No. CC032111-02.8 — Water Treatment Coagulant, Water Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $50,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE

Base Bid
1. Nalco Company** $48,000.00
2. Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.* $29,500.00
3. PENCCO, Inc. No Bid
4. Thatcher Company of Montana No Bid

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

9. No. CC032111-02.9 — Hydrofluosilicic Acid (Fluoride), Water Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $22,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Base Bid
1. Hawkins, Inc.** $85,280.00
2. PENCCO, Inc. No Bid
3. Thatcher Company of Montana No Bid

* Cashier's Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



No. CC032111-02

BID SUMMARY
March 21, 2011

10. No. CC032111-02.10 — Chlorine Gas, Water Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $22,000.00
ENGINEER'’S ESTIMATE

Base Bid
1. Hawkins, Inc.** $23,380.00
2. PENCCO, Inc. No Bid

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

11. No. CC032111-02.11 — Odor Control Chemical for Lift Stations, Water Reclamation Division
(Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $75,000.00

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $
Base Bid

1. Hawkins, Inc.** $68,640.00

2. Siemens Water Technologies Corp.** $77,520.00

3. PENCCO, Inc. No Bid

4. Thatcher Co of Montana No Bid

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

12. No. CC032111-02.12 — Sodium Chloride (Salt), Street Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $500,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE
Base Bid

1. Pheasant Country Express* $375,000.00
2. BlackStrap, Inc.* $380,000.00
3. BlackStrap, Inc.* $392,000.00
4. Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.* $359,500.00
5. Cargill, Inc.** $455,900.00
6. Cargill, Inc.** $549,650.00
7. Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.* (summer) $717,500.00"
8. Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.* (winter) $792,500.00*

! Alternate Product
* Cashier's Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



No. CC032111-02

BID SUMMARY
March 21, 2011

13. No. CC032111-02.13 — Sweeper Broom Refills, Street Division (Opened on March 15, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $30,000.00
ENGINEER’'S ESTIMATE

Base Bid
1. Old Dominion Brush Co.** $19,735.00
2. United Rotary Brush Corporation** $19,500.56
3. West Coast Equipment, Inc.* $22,576.40
4. Lacal Equipment Company, Inc. ("ot Provided) $25,018.50

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

14. No. CC032111-02.14 — New Current Year Model Wide Area Mower, Parks and Recreation
Department (Opened on March 17, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $55,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE

Base Bid
1. RDO Equipment** $49,350.00
2. Midwest Turf & Irrigation** $47,629.00
3. Turfwerks** $49,720.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



BID AWARD SUMMARY

LETTING DATE: March 15, 2011

PROJECT: Kepps Water Main Extension
Project No. W08-1702 / CIP No. 50625

RECOMMENDATION: Award Total Bid in the amount of $706,711.35 to
Hills Materials Company at the March 21, 2011 Council Meeting.

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY
CONTRACTORS TOTAL BID
Hills Materials Company $706,711.35
Ladner Excating & Trenching, LLC $845,215.80
Quinn Construction, Inc. $899,311.30
Mainline Contracting, Inc. $1,058,791.45

City staff recommends awarding this project to Hills Materials Company for a total bid amount
of $706,711.35 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation:

Water Water
FUNDING SOURCE TOTAL Enterprise Expansion
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $650,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $755,000.00 $ $
APPROPRIATION DATA:
Water Water
FUNDING SOURCE TOTAL Enterprise Expansion
COST CENTER 0933 0934
LINE ITEM 4381 4381
FUNDING CENTER 0602 0602
BID AMOUNT $706,711.35 $353,355.68 $353,355.67
oula 5/ /1
CONSULTANT: Fail At DATE. _ 3//L /{1
— L4 e — U
Greg Wierenga, PE ﬂ

CETEC Engineering Services, Inc.

PROJECT MANAGER: 1.2 % i DATEE 3/7¢ /77
Keith Jofirfson g 4
City of Rapid City
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KEPPS WATER MAIN EXTENSION
PROJECT NO. W08-1702 CIP NO. 50625



PROJECT NAME: KEPPS WATER MAIN EXTENSION

PROJECT NUMBER: PROJECT NO. W10-1702 / CIP NO. 50625

LET DATE: MARCH 15, 2011
LOW BID AMOUNT: $706,711.35

, HILLS MATERIALS LADNER EXCAVATING & MAINLINE CONTRACTING
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE B ANY thrbe SO QUINN CONSTRUCTION INC ol
ren |STO: BID
No | ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTy | UNITCOST |TOTAL COST| UNITCOST |TOTAL COST| UNITCOST |TOTAL COST| UNIT COST |TOTAL COST| UNIT COST | TOTAL COST
NO. UNIT | (EST)
MOBILIZATION S a0
1 LS 1 ‘ §35.00000  $27.500.00 |  $27.500.00|  $30.00000|  $30,000.00]  $72.000.00|  $72,00000]  §20.000.00|  $20.000.00
INCIDENTAL WORK TR
2 LS 1 ' $500000|  $45.00000 | 4500000  $2500000]  $25000.00]  $10,00000|  $10,00000|  §50.000.00|  $50,000.00
CONSTRUCTION STAKING 5 5
3 LS 1 ' s1250000]  si090000|  S1090000]  $11,00000]  $11.00000|  $1500000|  $15000.00|  $14.00000]  $14,000.00
RE-ESTABLISH PROPERTY
CORNERS $ 200
4 Ea. 8 $1,600.00 $234.60 §1,876.80 $250.00 §2,000.00 5260.00 52,000.00 $240.00 $1.920.00
CLEARING AND GRUBBING A
2,
5 LS 1 $5000.00]  $6,809.34 $6.809.34 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,000.00 §5,000.00 53,800.00 53.800.00
CLEARING AND GRUBBING TREES, > : o
6 6" DIA. Ea. 3 $1,200.00 $146.22 $438.66 $200.00 $600.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $650.00 $1.950.00
REMOVE AND DISPOSE AC " :
7 PAVEMENT SF 294 $284.00 $1.19 $349.86 $3.00 $882.00 $3.00 5882.00 §4.00 $1,176.00
REMOVE AND DISPOSE CURB AND . .
8 GUTTER LF 34 $170.00 $3.77 $128.18 $10.00 $340.00 $4.00 $136.00 $12.00 5408.00
REMOVE AND RESET SIGN ; 150
9 Ea. 2 $300.00 $221.32 $442.64 5200.00 $400.00 $250.00 $500.00 $240.00 $480.00
AASHTO T-180 SOIL TEST ; -
10 Ea. 2 $400.00 $228.74 $457.48 $300.00 $600.00 $175.00 $350.00 $180.00 $360.00
20" 1.D. CASING - TRENCHLESS 5 .~
11 CONSTRUCTION LF 330 $148,500.00 $408.00 | $134,640.00 $892.00]  $294,360.00 $400.00  $132,000.00 $800.00|  §264,000.00
12" PVC WATER MAIN . o
12 W/RESTRAINED JOINTS LF 2,480 $148,800.00 $44.00 | $109,120.00 $42.00]  $104,160.00 $86.00]  $213,280.00 $71.00|  $176,080.00
8" PVC WATER MAIN g -
13 W/RESTRAINED JOINTS LF 426 516.188.00 $29.50 $12,567.00 §38.00|  $16,188.00 57000|  §20.82000 §52.00]  $22,152.00
4"PVC WATER MAIN ; o
14 LF 10 $250.00 $24.00 $240.00 $30.00 $300.00 $50.00 $500.00 $64.00 $640.00
12°x 12" x 12" TEE ; -
15 Ea. 1 5000.00 $730.00 $730.00 5900.00 $900.00 $1.100.00 $1.100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00
12"x 12" x 8" TEE & 466
16 Ea. 2 $1,800.00 5615.00 $1,230.00 $777.00 $1.554.00 $1,100.00 §2,200.00 $950.00 $1.900.00
12" - 45" BEND " -~
17 Ea. 2 $1,200.00 5475.00 5950.00 $622.00 §1,244.00 5800.00 $1,600.00 $800.00 $1,600.00
12" -22%° BEND ; o0
18 Ea. 5 §3,000.00 $450.00 $2,260.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 5550.00 §2,750.00




12" -11%° BEND -
19 Ea. 6 $3,600.00 $435.00 $2,610.00 $600.00 $3,600.00 $800.00 $4.500.00 $770.00 $4,620.00
12" X 8" REDUCER
600
20 Ea. 1 $600.00 $330.00 $330.00 $500.00 $500.00 $800.00 $800.00 $440.00 $440.00
8" X 8" TAPPING SLEEVE, WITH 8"
4,000
21 GATE VALVE AND BOX Ea. 1 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $6,000.00 55,000.00 54,800.00 $4,800.00 $5,400.00 $5.400.00
8" x 8" x 8" TEE
550
22 Ea. 2 $1,100.00 $400.00 $800.00 $580.00 $1,160.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $760.00 $1,520.00
8" x 8" x 6" TEE
550
23 Ea. 3 $1,650.00 $370.00 $1,110.00 $550.00 $1,650.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 720,00 $2,160.00
8"x 8"x 4" TEE
550
24 Ea. 1 $550.00 $330.00 $330.00 $500.00 $500.00 $750.00 $750.00 $680.00 $680.00
8"-90° BEND
400
25 Ea. 3 $1,200.00 $285.00 $855.00 $440.00 $1.320.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $630.00 $1,890.00
8" -45° BEND
° 400
2 Ea. 2 $800.00 $265.00 $530.00 $420.00 $840.00 $600.00 $1,200,00 $600.00 $1.200.00
8" -22/4" BEND
400
27 Ea. 1 $400.00 $265.00 $265.00 $420.00 $420.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00
8" -11%° BEND
! 400
28 Ea. 3 $1,200.00 $260.00 $780.00 $412.00 $1,236.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
8" x 4" REDUCER
400
29 Ea. 1 $400.00 $225.00 $225.00 $365.00 $365.00 $500.00 $500.00 $320.00 $320.00
4" -45° BEND
300
30 Ea. 2 $600.00 $175.00 $350.00 $300.00 $600.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
12" GATE VALVE AND BOX
2,800
31 Ea. 4 $11,200.00 $2,150.00 $8,600.00 $2,450.00 $9,800.00 5320000  $12.800.00 $2,500.00|  $10.000.00
8" GATE VALVE AND BOX
1,600
32 Ea. 4 $6.400.00 $1,275.00 $5.100.00 $1,470.00 $5.880.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,400.00 §5,500.00
2" GATE VALVE AND BOX
800
33 Ea. 1 $800.00 $785.00 $785.00 $825.00 $825.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $840.00 $840.00
8" PLUG
300
34 Ea. 2 $600.00 $89.00 $178.00 $155.00 $310.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
12" CAP
500
35 Ea. 1 $500.00 §255.00 $255.00 $350.00 $350.00 $500.00 $500.00 $590.00 $590.00
CONNECT TO EXISTING WATER
1,200
36 MAIN Ea. 1 $1,200.00 $475.00 $475.00 $2,000.00 £2,000.00 $1,800.00 $1.800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
FIRE HYDRANT WITH AUXILIARY
3,600
2 VALVE Ea. 3 $10,800.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $4.000.00  $12.000.00 420000  $12,600.00 $4,300.00]  $12,900.00
6" PVC HYDRANT LEAD
3"
38 LFE 21 7 $735.00 $3.63 576.23 $32.00 $672.00 $30.00 $630.00 $42.00 $882.00
6"-45° BEND
400
39 Ea. 1 $400.00 $225.00 $225.00 $320.00 $320.00 $500.00 $500.00 $550.00 $550.00
CATHODIC PROTECTION ANODE, 18
150
40 LB. ZINC Ea. 36 i $5,400.00 $200.00 $7.200.00 $260.00 $9,360.00 $275.00 $9,900.00 $320.00 $11,520.00
CATHODIC PROTECTION TEST
500
1 STATION - FLUSH MOUNTED Ea. 3 $1,500.00 345,00 $1,035.00 §500.00 $1.500.00 $300.00 $900.00 $320.00 $960.00
SKYLINE CONTROL VAULT
22,000
42 LS 1 $22,000.00]  $22.749.30 $22,749.30 sazo00.00|  s3200000]  $31.00000]  §31,00000  $27.000.00]  $27,000.00
TYPE | BEDDING
25
43 Tons 150 $3,750.00 $18.50 $2,775.00 $18.00 $2,700.00 $18.00 $2,700.00 $20.00 $3,000.00




TYPE IIl FOUNDATION MATERIAL

25
44 Tons 50 $1,250.00 $14.50 $725.00 $18.00 $900.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $25.00 $1,250.00
ROCK EXCAVATION - TRENCH o
45 cY 100 $6,000.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $80.00 $8.000.00 $100.00]  $10,000.00
TOPSOIL, STRIP STOCKPILE AND i
46 REPLACE cy 390 $4.,680.00 $26.00 10,140.00 $4.00 $1,560.00 $6.00 $2,340.00 $18.00 $7,020.00
UNCLAGSSIFIED EXCAVATION - 0
47 ACCESS ROAD cY 1,494 $32,866.00 $20.00 $29,880.00 $37.00]  $55,278.00 $20.00|  $29.880.00 54500  $67.230.00
ROCK EXCAVATION - ACCESS ROAD p
48 cy 150 $7,500.00 $45.00 $6,750.00 $45.00 56,750.00 $70.00]  $10,500.00 $100.00|  $15.000.00
GABIONS -
49 cy 355 $88,750.00 $240.00 $85.200.00 $9500]  $33.726.00 525000  $88,750.00 $250.00]  $88.750.00
CLASS 1 RIPRAP %
50 Tons 22 $1,320.00 $84.00 $1,848.00 $65.00 $1,430.00 $60.00 $1,320.00 $54.00 $1,188.00
12" CMP CULVERT i
51 LF 360 $11,520.00 $31.25 $11,250.00 $20.00 $7,200.00 $5000|  $18.000.00 580.00|  $28,800.00
12" CMP - 10° Bend e
ol
52 Ea. 1 $250.00 $210.00 $210.00 $150.00 $150.00 $250.00 $250.00 $190.00 $190.00
74 TUBULAR GATE —"
53 Ea. 1 ' $2,00000|  $2.550.00 $2,560.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,200.00 51,200.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00
HAULING AND PLACING CO- -
54 COMPOST Tons 420 $10,500.00 $39.00 $16,380.00 $35.00  $14.700.00 $20.00]  $12.600.00 $100.00]  $42,000.00
ROCK CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE o
55 Tons 40 $1,200.00 $18.50 $740.00 $35.00 $1,400.00 $60.00 $2,400.00 $28.00 $1,120.00
CELLULAR GEOSYNTHETIC SOIL ;
56 REINFORCEMENT SF 4,325 $4,325.00 $1.85 $8,001.25 $2.00 $8,650.00 $2.80]  $12,110.00 $3.50|  $15.137.50
AGGREGATE BASE COURSE (1) o
57 Tons 697.6 $17,440.00 $25.00 $17.440.00 $16.00]  $11,161.60 $3300]  523.020.80 525000 $17.440.00
GEOTEXTILE FABRIC SUBGRADE 2
58 REINFORCEMENT sY 30 $120.00 $5.00 $150.00 $3.00 $90.00 $4.00 $120.00 $11.00 $330.00
ASPHALT CONCRETE COMPOSITE
(CLASS G-1) 110
59 Tons 51 $5,610.00 5145.00 $7.395.00 22500  $11.475.00 $175.00 $8,925.00 $215.00]  $10.965.00
HEAVY DUTY, SILT FENCE (WITH 0
60 BRACING) LF 1,985 $19,850.00 $6.10 $12,108.50 $9.00 $17.865.00 $8.00]  $15.880.00 $8.00 $15.,880.00
HIGH VELOCITY SILT FENCE _
2
61 LF 1,485 $7,425.00 $4.40 $6,534.00 $5.00 $7.425.00 $5.00 $7,425.00 $5.00 $7,425.00
9" EROSION CONTROL WATTLE 5
62 LF 700 $4,900.00 $4.40 $3,080.00 $4.25 $2,975.00 $4.50 $3,150.00 $4.50 $3.150.00
SURFACE ROUGHENING _—
63 SY 14,323 ) $4,206.90 $0.12 $1,718.76 $0.40 $5,729.20 50.50 $7.161.50 $0.65 $9,309.95
SEEDING AND FIBER MATRIX .
64 MULCHING sy 14,323 ’ $37,239.80 $3.05 $43.685.15 $3.00|  $42,969.00 5200  $28,646.00 $2.00]  $28,646.00
2" PVC CONDUIT, SCHEDULE 40 .
65 LF 1,704 $6,816.00 $0.75 $1,278.00 $3.00 $5,112.00 $5.00 $8,520.00 $7.00|  $11,928.00
2" PVC CONDUIT, SCHEDULE 80 '_
66 LF 160 ? $800.00 $1.12 $179.20 $3.15 $504.00 $6.00 5950.00 $7.00 $1,120.00
18" JUNCTION BOX w00
67 Ea. 4 $2,000.00 $309.00 $1.236.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 5500.00 $2,000.00 $410.00 $1,640.00
CONCRETE P6 GUTTER o
68 LF 34 $1,020.00 $26.00 $884.00 $24.00 $816.00 $25.00 $850.00 $21.00 $714.00




BCC DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT 6", NON-
69 REINFORCED WITH CUSHION SF 145, ° i $1,450.00 $8.00 $1,160.00 $7.00 $1,015.00 $9.00 $1,305.00 $6.00 $670.00
WATER POLLUTION CONTROL " .
70 LS 1 $4,000.00]  $1.010.00 $1.010.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
TRAFFIC CONTROL " -
71 LS 1 ~ $2,500.00]  $3.110.00 53.110.00 $3,000.00 53,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,500.00 $3.500.00
TOTAL e $751,117.70 | $706,711.35 $845,215.80 $899,31 1.30% $1,058,791.45

CONSULTANT
| certify that, to the best of my knowledge, this is a true tabulation
of bids recéjved for this project.

2N Df//é///

Greg Wi;{r?'@a.LPE’
CETEC Erigineering Services, Inc.

CITY OF RAPID CITY

Reviewed by:

Sty . TR
Keith Johsofl Date 7




