## **ADVERTISING AUTHORITY**

This form must be completed and approved by the City Finance Office prior to presenting items to the Common Council and/or Committees of the Common Council. This covers all items which require formal bids, currently anything over \$25,000 (except emergency and repair costs).

١.	PROJEC	TID	NO.:														
II.		PROJECT NAME: Project/Item(s) Description: Request permission to Purchase from April 5, 2004															
III.	Project/It	em(s)	) Descripti		ontract	w/RDC	ssion to I DEquipm # 34: 1976	ent (	Co:(1) N								
IV.	BID LET	TING	DATE:		(replacern	Jile Waa	5	Out 120	,								
V.			Grant No	n.:													
٧.	(ii applied	,	Funding		ce.												
			Estimate			n Date											
			Estimate		•												
VI.	ESTIMAT	ren (		o Oi	ant Nec	cipt De	ito.										
Vł.	PROJEC																
VII.	BASIS O	F PA	YMENT	As	sessed			Non-	1								
								_∣ As	sessed	<b>—</b>							
					Single		X		Partial								
					_ P:	ayment											
VIII.	DISBURS	SEME	ENT SCHE	EDUL	E												
	Date		Amou	nt	Amo	ount	Amou	nt	Amour	it	An	nount					
			\$		\$		\$	\$	,	\$	,						
			\$		\$		\$	\$		\$							
			\$		\$		\$	\$			\$						
			\$		\$		\$	\$		\$							
			\$		\$		\$	\$		\$							
			\$		\$		\$	\$		\$							
	Total	<u> </u>	\$		\$		\$	\$		\$							
IX.		RIAT	ION DATA	Δ	Ψ		<u> </u>		•								
177.				`		.,			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·								
	F	und	101								+						
	Departn	nent	302														
	Line I	tem	4360														
X.			T/DIVISIO		ignature	es)											
Λ.	Project M			(0	igitoria. c					Date							
	1 TOJOCE IV		01-13-05														
	DEDART	MEN	T/DIV/ISIO	N MZ	NAGEF	₹				Date							
	DEPARTMENT/DIVISION MANAGER  Don Brumbaugh											3-05					
:	PUBLIC \		Date		766												
			<u> </u>	11.	165												
CINIAN	OF OFFICE	1105.7	NII V	(_	<del>/</del> -		Ann	oved			arh.	оп Сору					
FINAN	CE OFFICE	USE (	,	Initial Yes					No			nt Desk					
Approp	riation	1/1	Date				1/			Public Works							
Cash F		1/20				_   _				Engine							
	,		-			_   _				Project Manager							

	Bidder Equpment Description and Deviations	1 1 2 1 1 2 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	Lähn Deene 7/10CH Senes 2, warranty per speoffcatoris, cylinder     saterison/beriter skritt, driss is not required on the John Deere	Trador graden was a straight as straight to the straight to th		naber slop for Roading, michrount scanfler provided in bid, DEDUCT for providing Political Final Scanfler (1898), wing lights not reverseled for bid, winn linkt scanfler (1898), wing lights	(\$139) to remove wing lights	0 Volvo G726B, one full year warranty	0			in recreases acception of the more market many great, notified than ded number balled, afterfales in from the feeled, afterfales in from a feel.		Caterpillar 140H, and Caterpillar 143H (all wheel drive) No Deviations or Vanations noted		0	0					D	0		0			0		THE PARTY OF THE P		THE RESIDENCE OF THE PROPERTY					
	Atternate G 7th year	- Table 1 - V	8,300 00	\$ 175,675,00	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 184,537.00		\$ 930000	\$ 185,337 00	\$ 158,000.00					achinery		\$ 6,000 00			\$		\$ 217,975.00	\$ I		\$ 64,600 00			\$ 132,975.00									
	Alternate F 6th year	A	15	\$= 173,595.00	6,800 00	182,837 00		7,300 00	163,337 00	157,000 00					Butler M																						
	Altamata E 5th year	1 m	4,360,00	171,735 00 \$	\$ 6,200 00 \$	\$ 182,237.00 \$		\$ 670000 \$	\$ 182,737 00 \$	\$ 156,000.00					chunery		\$ 6,000.00	H				\$ 188,215.00			\$ 60,800 00	<del>                                      </del>		\$ 108,215.00			\$ 205,720	1000 100	107,822	/ 7 years	700 hours	22	
	Alternate D 4th year		3,230.00	170,606,00	5,300 00	181,337 00		5,700 00	181,737.00	155,000 00					Butter Mactunery									•							chase	density of	חמא המביי		700 hours		
4	Alternate C 3rd year	1	2,150.00 \$	9	4,500 00 \$	\$ 180,537 00 \$		\$ 4,900 00 \$	\$ 180,937 00 \$	\$ 154,000.00 \$					sck Sales		\$ 3,000 00	11				\$ 206,724.00	108,302		\$ 82,309.52			\$ 98,422 00			Intial purchase	Section of the sectio	Commence				nson
City Estimated Trade-In	Atternate B 2nd year	discount.	1,130.00	5 168,505.00	\$ 3,500 00 \$	S 179 937 00 S		\$ 4,200.00	\$ 180,237.00	\$ 154,000.00	Does not meet snecifications			No Bid	Sheehan Mack Sales																						oid, it is not meant to be a companson
	Alternat A	72CH-II	\$ 22,600.00	\$ 167,375,00	\$ 17.376.00	\$ 176,037.00		\$ 17,376.00	3 176 037 00	No Bid	toon too				Aack Sales	1	\$ 3,000 00					189,348.00	l ſ		\$ 75,002 12		11	\$ 87,997 00									ad, it is not mea
	Beder Trade-in		\$ 4,000.00	S1	\$ 300000			3,000 00	ST	1 000 00					Sheehan M														- 1			all whi dr.				$\overline{}$	
Price ided Price	Bedder Alternate Bid No Bid	1	\$ ~~ 140,775.00	ATOT TOTA	\$ 155 661 00	TOTALS		\$ 155,661.00	TOTALS	153,000 00					ment Co	183,120,00	4,000.00	*		\$	A Committee of the Comm	\$ 179,126.06	91,086 00		\$ 74,402.48			\$ 81,222.00				175,675 7 yr warranty, all whi dr.					out nght bid Vs
City Estimated Unit Price City Estimated Extended Price	Bidder Base Bid	^	\$ 144,775.00		\$ 158 661 00 \$			\$ 158,661.00		\$ 154 000 00   \$				No Bid	RDO Equpment Co	383	AND SOCIAL STREET, STR					Water State of State	A A AN AND A				a company						<b>∞</b>			15.67	w of a purchase
No. BIDDER ADDRESS C	Kurk Hanson 1540 i aurel Bandits Dr. Cirv	13	10 to	W A A Area	3 Sheehan Mack Sales & Equip 1810 Deadwood Ave City			4 Sheehan Mack Sales & Equip 1810 Deachwood Ave City		5 JD Evens Inc 2460 Deadwood Ave City			Butler Machinery	3601 Deadwood Ave City	TOTAL COST BID OPTION	1 Bid	2 Less Trade-in	4 Bidder shall cover all repair costs	Repairs as described in normal	5 Scheduled maintenance costs	for 7 years or 5,000 hours	Total	in 7 years (covered by	of bid figure in this item)	7 Net Present Value of repurchase	76 times Item 6	total (Item #3 + #4 + #5 - #6)	Total				Actual -	Total	Angual	Annual hours	NOU DON	Note This is merely an overview of a purchase out right bid Vs. a Total-cost