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SUMMARY OF ADOPTION ACTION 
 

Amendment to the  
Comprehensive Plan  

 
On July 18, 2011, the Rapid City Council approved an amendment to the 

Comprehensive Plan.  The amendment will revise the Comprehensive Plan to change the land 
use designation from General Commercial with a Planned Commercial Development to Medium 
Density Residential with a Planned Residential Development for a portion of the SW¼ of the 
SW¼ of Section 16, T1N, R8E, BHM, Rapid City, Pennington County, South Dakota more fully 
described as follows: Commencing at the southwesterly corner of Section 16, T1N, R8E, 
thence, N69°10’45”E, a distance of 1416.06 feet, to a point on the northerly edge of East 
Minnesota Street right-of-way, and the point of beginning; Thence, first course: N45°27’18”W, 
along the northerly edge of said East Minnesota Street right-of-way, a distance of 522.14 feet; 
Thence, second course: northwesterly, along the northerly edge of said East Minnesota Street 
right-of-way, curving to the left, on a curve with a radius of 3050.00 feet, a delta angle of 
07°24’33”, a length of 394.41 feet, a chord bearing of N49°09’35”W, and chord distance of 
394.14 feet; Thence, third course: N52°51’51”W, along the northerly edge of said East 
Minnesota Street right-of-way, a distance of 72.61 feet; Thence, fourth course: N07°51’51”W, 
along the northerly edge of said East Minnesota Street right-of-way, a distance of 35.36 feet, to 
the easterly edge of Marlin Drive right-of-way; Thence, fifth course: N37°08’09”E, along the 
easterly edge of said Marlin Drive right-of-way, a distance of 143.34 feet, to a point on the east-
west section 1/16th line; Thence, sixth course: S89°56’57”E, along the east-west section 1/16th 
line, a distance of 647.74 feet, to the SW 1/16th corner of said Section 16; Thence, seventh 
course: S00°05’15”W, along the north-south section 1/16th line, a distance of 816.57 feet, to the 
point of beginning, more generally described as being located east of the intersection of East 
Minnesota Street and Marlin Drive, and containing approximately 7.718 acres, more or less. 
Copies of the Comprehensive Plan and amendments are available for public inspection at the 
Rapid City Finance Office, 300 Sixth Street, Rapid City, South Dakota during regular business 
hours, Monday through Friday, from 7:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
 
 
 


