

BID AWARD SUMMARY

LETTING DATE: November 10, 2015

PROJECT: Rapid Transit Bus Storage Facility – Expansion
Project No. 15-2248 / CIP No. 51084

RECOMMENDATION: Award Total Base Bid plus Alternate 2 in the amount of \$1,108,600.00 to MAC Construction Company at the December 7, 2015 Council Meeting.

BIDDERS' SUMMARY

<u>CONTRACTORS</u>	<u>BASE BID</u>	<u>ALTERNATE 1</u>	<u>ALTERNATE 2</u>	<u>UNIT COST</u>
MAC Construction Company	\$954,900.00	\$78,700.00	\$153,700.00	\$92.00
SECO Construction, Inc.	\$974,000.00	\$91,500.00	\$175,000.00	\$92.00
R C S Construction, Inc.	\$1,020,000.00	\$83,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$45.00
First Dakota Enterprises, Inc.	\$1,030,000.00	\$99,000.00	\$187,500.00	\$110.00
Dean Kurtz Construction	\$1,041,500.00	\$78,500.00	\$159,000.00	\$75.00
Black Hills Garage Doors	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid


City staff recommends awarding this project to MAC Construction Company for a total bid amount of \$1,108,600.00 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation:

FUNDING SOURCE	TOTAL	CIP Govt Buildings
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY	\$1,000,000.00	\$
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	\$1,000,000.00	\$

APPROPRIATION DATA:

FUNDING SOURCE	TOTAL	CIP Govt Buildings
COST CENTER		8915
LINE ITEM		4320
FUNDING CENTER		0505
BID AMOUNT	\$1,108,600.00	\$1,108,600.00

PROJECT MANAGER:


 Rod Johnson, PE
 City of Rapid City

DATE:

11-23-15