No. CC121712-02

BID SUMMARY
December 17, 2012

1. No. CC121712-02.1 — 2012 Fire Hydrant Installation Annual Project, Project No. 12-2040 /
CIP No. 50808 (Opened on December 11, 2012)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $75,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $69,000.00
Base Bid
1. Quinn Construction, Inc.** $92,820.00
2. Highmark, Inc.** $63,640.05
3. R.C.S. Construction, Inc.** $61,160.00
4. Lind-Exco, Inc.** $81,217.02
5. Siteworks Specialists, Inc.** $63,105.00
6. Hills Materials Company** $68,889.50
7. Mainline Contracting, Inc.** $70,918.00
2. No. CC121712-02.2 — Shooting Star Well Abandonment, Project No. 12-2049 / CIP No. 50913
(Opened on December 11, 2012)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $10,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $10,510.00
Base Bid

1. Antler Enterprises, Inc.* $14,950.00
2. R.C.S. Construction, Inc.** $23,371.90
3. Quinn Construction, Inc.** $19,210.00
4. Hills Materials Company** $14,485.00

3. No. CC121712-02.3 — 6th and 7th Street Overlay, Project No. 12-2064 / CIP No. 50844
(Opened on December 11, 2012)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $150,000.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $131,000.00

Base Bid
1. Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.** $121,156.00
2. J&J Asphalt Company** $117,304.06
3. Hills Materials Company** $111,917.30

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



No. CC121712-02
BID SUMMARY
December 17, 2012

4, No. CC121712-02.4 — High Nitrate Content Hay Bales — Public Works Department, Water
Reclamation Division (Opened on December 11, 2012)

Lot 1 Lot 2 Lot 3 Lot 4 Lot5 Lot 6
1. Tony O’Neill $1,235 $2,499 $392 $980 $588 $1,617
2. Dan Lewis $969 $* $408 $200 $120 $*
3. Jones Ranch Partnership  $2,090 $* $1,080 $2,700 $1,620 $*
4. Dean Hartford $1,463 $* $* $* $* $*
5. Darin Klapperich $1,045 $* $* $* $* $*

$*=No Bid

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



CC121712-02.4

BID AWARD SUMMARY

LETTING DATE: December 11, 2012

PROJECT: High Nitrate Content Hay Bales

Water Reclamation Division

RECOMMENDATION: Award bids by lot as follows: Lot 1, 3, 4 and 5 to Jones
Ranch Partnership for a total of $7,490.00; and Lot 2 and 6 to Tony O’Neill for a

total of $4,116.00.

L mm————

BIDDER’S SUMMARY

'é‘;’: ;S“(;\f;’fg%f fass | $1,235.00 $969.00 $7:090.00 $1,463.00 $1,045.00
'(-Iggﬁj‘zf"fa'fa Bales No bid No bid No bid No bid
'('[‘:’iteﬁj_z)mfa'fa Bales | 439200 $408.00 $1.080.00 No bid No bid
(L‘Siteégﬁ'fa'fa Bales | $980.00 $200.00 | $2,700.50 No bid No bid
'(-Iﬁ’itef;%ﬁ')fa'fa Bales | 458800 $12000 | $165060 No bid No bid
(LISIL? d"ﬁé').fa'fa Bales | &1 gii00 No bid No bid No bid
Total Award: $4i'i§5§90

Project Manager: _( M Q@ xjﬁ.@

Date: December 11, 2012




