No. CC0416212-02

BID SUMMARY
April 16, 2012

4, No. CC041612-02.4 — Sweeper Broom Refills, Street Division (Opened on April 10, 2012)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $30,000.00

Total Bid
1. Lacal Equipment Inc. $34,452.00
2. M-B Companies, Inc.** $20,576.08
3. Old Dominion Brush Company, Inc.** $20,020.00
* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted
5. No. CC041612-02.5 — Two (2) New Current Model Year Vacuum Street Sweepers, Street
Division (Opened on April 10, 2012)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $400,000.00

Unit (2) Trade In Combined Total
1. Sheehan Mack Sales & Equipment Inc.** $426,990.00 $15,000.00 $411,990.00
2. Northern Truck Equipment Corporation** $472,970.00 $22,970.00 $450,000.00
3. Sanitation Products, Inc.** $390,000.00 $2,500.00 $387,500.00
* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted
6. No. CC041612-02.6 — Four (4) New Current Model Year 1-Ton 4x4 Regular Cab Long Box
Pickups, Street Division (Opened on April 10, 2012)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $95,000.00
Base Bid

1. Rapid Chevrolet Cadillac No Bid
2. McKie Buick GMC, Inc.* $98,884.00
3. McKie Ford Lincoln, Inc.* $96,696.00

* Cashier's Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



BID AWARD SUMMARY

LETTING DATE: April 10, 2012

CC041612-02.6

PROJECT: Four (4) One Ton 4x4 Regular Cab Long Box Pickups - Street

Division

RECOMMENDATION: Award Total Bid in the amount of $96,696.00 to McKie

Ford Lincoln Inc. at the April 16, 2012 Council Meeting.

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY
VENDORS Unit Price
McKie Ford Lincoln Inc. $24,174.00
McKie Buick GMC Inc. $24,721.00
Rapid Chevrolet Cadillac No Bid
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY
FUNDING SOURCE Street Cleaning | Sfreet Dept. Snow Removal [ Street Dept.
COST CENTER 0401 0301 0302 0301
LINE ITEM 4360 4360 4360 4360
FUND 0101 011 0101 0101
ESTIMATED COST: $23,750.00 $23,750.00 $23,750.00 $23,750.00
APPROPRIATION DATA
FUNDING SOURCE Street Cleaning | Sfreet Dept. Snow Removal | Street Dept.
COST CENTER 0401 0301 0302 0301
LINE ITEM 4360 4360 4360 4360
FUNDING CENTER 011 0101 0101 0101
BID AMOUNT - $24,174.00 $24,174.00 $24,174.00 $24,174.00

Project Manager

Total Bid
$96,696.00
$98,884.00

No Bid

Date: "‘“_/I,l«/lgw




Bid Tabulation for: 1 Ton 4x4 Regular Cab Long Box Pickups

Bid Receive Date: April 10, 2012 Funding: 0101/0401/4360
Department: Streets Funding: 0101/0301/4360
Project Manager: Don Brumbaugh/Gena Miller Funding: 0101/0302/4360
Item McKie Ford Lincoln Inc. McKie Buick GMC Inc. Rapid Chevrolet Cadillac
No. Description Quantity Rapid City, SD Rapid City, SD Rapid City, SD
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price
Current model year 1-Ton
4x4 Regular Cab Long
Box Pickups 4 |$ 2417400 $ 96,696.00| $ 24,721.00 | $ 98,884.00 No Bid No Bid

Recommended Vendor: McKie Ford Lincoln Inc.
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