No. CC121911-02

BID SUMMARY
December 19, 2011

1. No. CC121911-02.1 — Five (5) — 2012 Police Car(s), Rapid City Police Department (Opened on
December 6, 2011)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $145,000.00
ENGINEER’'S ESTIMATE

Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
1. McKie Ford Lincoln, Inc.* 5 $30,405.00 $152,025.00

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted

2. No. CC0120511-02.2 — Rapid City Greenway Trails and Pedestrian Facilities Project, City of
Rapid City Project No. PR08-6017 / SDDOT Project No. EM 8052(59) PCN 010E (Opened on December
8, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $2,312,278.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE $2,293,190.92
Total Bid

1. Scull Construction Service, Inc.** $3,186,704.94
2. Concrete Complete, Inc.** $2,990,339.94
3. R.C.S. Construction, Inc.** $2,232,268.93
4. Ainsworth Benning Construction, Inc.** $2,453,816.15
5. Hills Materials Company** $2,705,614.34
6. Heavy Constructors, Inc.** $2,624,811.00
7. MAC Construction Co., Inc.** $2,501,613.25
8. Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.** $2,830,192.20

* Cashier’'s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted
** Bid Bond Submitted



BID SUMMARY
December 19, 2011

No. CC121911-02

3. No. CC121911-02.3 — High Nitrate Content Hay Bales, Water Reclamation Division (Opened on

December 13, 2011)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

I-?r;lr?(lzi']; KIa|cl))paer:inch'\‘A Dan Lewis™
Lot 1 — 2011 Mixed Grass Bales (Field 5) $1,455.00 $1,261.00 No bid
Lot 2 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 2) $530.00 No bid No bid
Lot 3 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 2) $3,542.00 No bid $3,300.50
Lot 4 — 2010 Alfalfa Bales (Field 2) $168.00 No bid No bid
Lot 5 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 3) $120.00 No bid $123.00
Lot 6 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 3) $1,170.00 No bid $1,599.00
Lot 7 — 2010 Alfalfa Bales (Field 3) $69.00 No bid No bid
Lot 8 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 6A) $1,872.00 No bid $1,599.00
Lot 9 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 6B) $2,310.00 No bid $2,152.50
Lot 10 — 2011 Alfalfa Bales (Field 6C) $3,256.00 No bid $1,924.00
Lot 11 — 2010 Alfalfa Bales (Field 6C) $168.00 No bid $1,680.00

* Cashier's Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted

** Bid Bond Submitted



RAPID CITY POLICE DEPARTMENT

Steve Allender, Chief of Police

December 13, 2011

City Finance
300 6" Street
Rapid City, SD 57701

This letter is to acknowledge that we have reviewed the recent bid
award for five new police cars for $152,025.

These cars fit our needs and are equipped properly to allow our
employees to perform their jobs in a safe and efficient manner.

Our staff recommendation is to accept the bid submitted by McKie Ford
Lincoln, Inc. in the amount of $152.025.

Sincerely,
Steve Allender

Chief of Police
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