No. CC081610-02

BID SUMMARY
August 16, 2010

e No. CC081610-02.1 — Dealer Demonstrator Pumper Truck (Opened on August 10, 2010)

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $800,000.00
If paid at time
of final

Bidder Type Total Bid Option 1 Option 2 inspection
Smeal Fire Apparatus Freedom Series
Co. 3892 $453,752.00 No Bid No Bid
Front Range Fire
Apparatus Pierce Arrow 22786 $432,649.00 $22,298.00 $14,948.00 ($2,736.00)
Front Range Fire
Apparatus Pierce Arrow 22616 $436,038.00 $26,298.00 $14,948.00 ($2,620.00)
Ed M. Feld Equipment $329,764.00 (1) $12,997.00 (1)
Co. Inc. Not Listed $653,528.00 (2) No Bid $25,994.00 (2)
Rosenbauer Central

Division Stock Pumper 2915 $472,541.00 No Bid No Bid
Rosenbauer Central Stock Pumper

Division 14813 $379,032.00 No Bid No Bid
Rosenbauer Central Stock Pumper

Division 14357 $350,743.00 No Bid No Bid
Rosenbauer Central Stock Pumper

Division (Proposal 2) $345,760.00 No Bid No Bid
Rosenbauer Central

Division Stock Pumper 3029 $327,550.00 No Bid No Bid

e No. CC081610-02.2 — Well No. 10 Pump Replacement — Project No. W10-1889 / CIP No. 50831 (Opened on August 10,

2010)
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $60,000.00
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $75,420.00
Bidder Total Bid
Weston Engineering Inc. | $93,990.00




