
No. CC062110-02 
 

BID SUMMARY 
June 21, 2010 

 
 No. CC062110-02.1 – Silver Street Area Utility Improvements – Project No. SSW07-1656 / CIP No. 

50418 (Opened June 15, 2010) 
 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $2,650,000.00 
 

BIDDER BASE BID 
ALTERNATE 

NO. 1 
ALTERNATE 

NO. 2 

Engineer’s Estimate $2,744,557.00 $70,117.00 $48,585.00 
 

Hills Materials Company* $2,883,919.00 $67,888.80 $47,564.75 

Rapid Construction Company * $2,520,463.42 $64,861.98 $45,758.65 

Heavy Constructors Inc. * $2,432,136.44 $65,509.04 $45,263.15 

R.C.S. Construction Inc. * $2,753,353.00 $70,657.00 $48,825.00 

Mainline Contracting Inc. * $2,541,629.50 $65,278.25 $45,603.75 
 
 
 No. CC062110-02.2 – Twenty-Four (24) Street Light LED Luminaries (Opened June 15, 2010) 
 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $44,000.00 (for both luminary projects) 
 

BIDDER Unit Price Extended Price 

Graybar Electric Inc.* $624.58 $14,989.92 

Dakota Supply Group $950.00 $22,800.00 
 
 
 No. CC062110-02.3 – Twenty-Four (24) Street Light Induction Luminaries (Opened June 15, 2010) 
 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $44,000.00 (for both luminary projects) 
 

BIDDER Unit Price Extended Price 

Graybar Electric Inc.* $333.12 $7,994.88 

Dakota Supply Group $400.00 $9,600.00 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

BID AWARD SUMMARY 
 

LETTING DATE:  June 15, 2010 
 
 

 PROJECT: Energy Efficient Street Light Pilot Project – INDUCTION Luminaires  
 
 
 RECOMMENDATION:  Award Total Bid in the amount of $7,994.88 to Graybar 

Electric, Inc. at the June 21, 2010 Council Meeting. 
 
 
 

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY 
 
     
CONTRACTORS    TOTAL BID
Graybar Electric Inc.   $7,994.88 

   

Dakota Supply Group   $9,600.00 (No bid bond) 
DataLED Technologies, Inc.  No Bid 
 
City staff recommends awarding to Graybar Electric, Inc. for a total bid amount of $7,994.88 
based on unit pricing with the following appropriation: 
 
 
 

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY                                                         APPROPRIATION DATA

FUNDING SOURCE 

  

Traffic 

COST CENTER 0304 

LINE ITEM 4269 

FUND 0101 

ESTIMATED COST: $22.000.00 

 
*Project funded through Department of Energy Grant. 
 

 
 

FUNDING SOURCE Traffic* 

COST CENTER 0304 

LINE ITEM 4269 

FUNDING CENTER 0101 

BID AMOUNT $7,994.88 

Date:  June 16, 2010 



Funding: 
Street Light INDUCTION Project No.:

CIP No.:

Sioux Falls SD RC SD Beaverton OR
Item Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
No. Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price

1
Street Light Induction 
Luminaires 24 333.12$               7,994.88$            400.00$               9,600.00$            

Recommended Vendor:  Graybar Electric, Inc.

** NO BID **

Graybar Electric Inc. DataLED Technologies Inc.

DOE Grant

PW Agenda No.:
NAJune 15, 2010
PW051110-09

Dakota Supply Group (no bid bond)

Bid Tabulation for:

Bid Open Date:
Department:

Project Manager:

Energy Efficient Street Light Pilot Project

Traffic
Toni Broom/John Less
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