
No. CC050310-02 
 

BID SUMMARY 
May 3, 2010 

 
 
 No. CC050310-02.6 – Sweeper Broom Refills (Opened April 27, 2010) 
 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $30,000.00 
 

 M-B Companies* United Rotary 
Brush Co. 

Sheehan Mack 
Sales & Equip.* 

Old Dominion 
Brush Co.* 

Item 1: Poly 
Broom Segments 

$2,190.00 No Bid $1,217.50 $2,795.00 

Item 2: Main 
Broom 

$5,616.00 No Bid $6,934.80 $5,040.00 

Item 3: Two 
Piece Main 
Broom 

$2,340.00 
 

No Bid $3,005.00 $2,800.00 

Item 4: Gutter 
Broom Wire 

$9,500.00 No Bid $12,200.00 $9,900.00 

Item 5: Total $19,646.00 No Bid $23,357.30 $20,535.00 
 

 
 No. CC050310-02.7 – 2010 Water Reclamation Facility Improvements – Project No. WRF10-1856 / 

CIP No. 50791 (Opened April 27, 2010) 
 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $2,600,000.00 
 
 1.   MAC Construction Co. Inc.*  $2,267,509.00 
 2.   Dean Kurtz Construction*  $2,502,537.95 
 3.   R.C.S. Construction Inc.*  $2,128,968.40 
 4.   J Scull Construction Service Inc.*  $2,249,119.28 
 5.   SECO Construction*  $2,250,800.03 
  
 
* Bid Bond Submitted 
** Cashier’s Check, Money Order or Bank Draft Submitted 



 

BID AWARD SUMMARY 
 

LETTING DATE:  April 27, 2010  
 
 

 PROJECT: Sweeper Broom Refills – Street Division   
 
 
 RECOMMENDATION:  Award Total Bid in the amount of $19,646.00 to  
  M - B Companies at the May 4, 2010 Council Meeting. 
 
 
 

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY 
 
 
CONTRACTORS     TOTAL BID 
 
Sheehan Mack Sales & Equipment                    $23,357.30 
Old Dominion Brush Company                           $20,535.00 
M-B Companies                                                  $19,646.00 
United Rotary Brush Corporation                          No Bid 
 
 
 
City staff recommends awarding to M – B Companies for a total bid amount  
of $19,646.00 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation: 
 
 

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY                                                         APPROPRIATION DATA  

FUNDING SOURCE Street Cleaning 

COST CENTER 0401 

LINE ITEM 4253 

FUND 0101 

ESTIMATED COST: $30,000.00 

 
 
 
 
 
PROJECT MANAGER:__________________________ DATE:______________________ 
 

FUNDING SOURCE Street Cleaning 

COST CENTER 0401 

LINE ITEM 4253 

FUNDING CENTER 0101 

BID AMOUNT $ 








