
No. CC011910-02 
 

BID SUMMARY 
January 19, 2010 

 
 
 
 No. CC011910-02.1 – E. St. Francis Street, E. St. Anne Street and Birch Ave. Street Reconstruction 

Project Phase Two – Project Three; Project No. ST09-1823 / CIP No. 50424 (Opened January 12, 
2010) 

 
 ADVERTISING AUTHORITY      $1,750,000.00 
 
 1.   Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.*     $1,670,588.09 
 2.   Hills Materials Company *     $1,643,683.77 
 3.   R.C.S. Construction Inc. *      $1,742,314.30 
 4.   Mainline Contracting Inc. *     $1,498,400.00 
 5.   Lind Exco Inc. *       $1,722,172.59 
 
 
 
 No. CC011910-02.2 – New Cold Water Meters (Opened January 12, 2010) 

 
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $145,000.00
 
 HD Supply 

Waterworks 
Elster AMCO 

Water Inc. 
BadgerMeter 

Inc. 
1.   ¾” Positive Displacement Oscillating 
Piston Type Cold Water Meters $48,200.00 25,600.00 No Bid 

2.  1” Positive Displacement Oscillating 
Piston Type Cold Water Meters $30,800.00 20,000.00 No Bid 

3.  1 ½” Compound Cold Water Meters $27,375.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.  2” Compound Cold Water Meters $31,125.00 No Bid No Bid 

5.  3” Compound Cold Water Meters $3,090.00 No Bid No Bid 

6.  4” Compound Cold Water Meters $5,190.00 No Bid No Bid 

7.  1 ½” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters $19,675.00 No Bid No Bid 

8.  2” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters $22,800.00 No Bid No Bid 

9.  3” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters $2,212.00 No Bid No Bid 

10. 4” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters $4,080.00 No Bid No Bid 

11. 6” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters $3,576.00 No Bid No Bid 

12. Remote Touch Pad Equipment $6,146.00 1,975.50 No Bid 

13. Total Price of All Meters $204,269.00 $47,575.50 No Bid 

 
 
   
 
* Bid Bond Submitted 

















 

BID AWARD SUMMARY 
 

LETTING DATE:  January 12, 2010 
 

 PROJECT: New Cold Water Meters  
 
 
 RECOMMENDATION:  Award Total Bid in the amount of $204,269.00 to HD 

Supply Waterworks at the January 19, 2010, Council Meeting. 
 
 
 

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY 
 
 
CONTRACTOR              

  
TOTAL BID 

HD Supply Waterworks $204,269.00 
Elster AMCO Water, Inc. $47,575.50* 
 
 
 
*Did not bid on all meters.  Meters that were bid do not meet required specifications. 
 
 
City staff recommends awarding this product to HD Supply Waterworks for a total bid amount of 
$204,269.00 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation: 
 

FUNDING SOURCE 
Water 

Billing/Service 

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $145,000.00 

ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE  

 

FUNDING SOURCE 

APPROPRIATION DATA: 

Water 
Billing/Service 

COST CENTER 7014 

LINE ITEM 4269 

FUNDING CENTER 0602 

BID AMOUNT $204,269.00 
 
 

 

 
Date:  January 14, 2010 



Bid Tabulation for:  Cold Water Meters Funding:   0602/7014/4269
Bid Receive Date:  January 12, 2010 Project No. NA / CIP No. NA
Department: Water PW120109-13
Project Manager:  Connie/Toni

Item
No. Description Quantity City State City State City State

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price

1

3/4" Positive Displacement 
Oscillating Piston Type Cold 
Water Meters, Meeting 
AWWA Standards, Per 
Each 400 64.00$                 25,600.00$          NO BID 120.50$               48,200.00$          

2

1" Positive Displacement 
Oscillating Piston Type Cold 
Water Meters, Meeting 
AWWA Standards, Per 
Each 200 100.00$               20,000.00$          NO BID 154.00$               30,800.00$          

3

1-1/2" Compound Cold 
Water Meters, Meeting 
AWWA Standards, Per 
Each 25 NO BID NO BID 1,095.00$            27,375.00$          

4
2" Compound Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 25 NO BID NO BID 1,245.00$            31,125.00$          

5
3" Compound Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 2 NO BID NO BID 1,545.00$            3,090.00$            

6
4" Compound Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 2 NO BID NO BID 2,595.00$            5,190.00$            

Elster/AmcoWater Badger Meter HD Supply Waterworks



Item
No. Description Quantity City State City State City State

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price

Elster/AmcoWater Badger Meter HD Supply Waterworks

7

1-1/2" Turbine Type Cold 
Water Meters, Meeting 
AWWA Standards, Per 
Each 25 NO BID NO BID 787.00$               19,675.00$          

8
2" Turbine Type Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 25 NO BID NO BID 912.00$               22,800.00$          

9
3" Turbine Type Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 2 NO BID NO BID 1,106.00$            2,212.00$            

10
4" Turbine Type Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 2 NO BID NO BID 2,040.00$            4,080.00$            

11
6" Turbine Type Cold Water 
Meters, Meeting AWWA 
Standards, Per Each 1 NO BID NO BID 3,576.00$            3,576.00$            

12
Remote Touch Pad 
Equipment, Per Detailed 
Specifications, Per Each 439 4.50$                   1,975.50$            NO BID 14.00$                 6,146.00$            

13 Total 47,575.50$          204,269.00$        

Recommended Vendor:  HD Supply Waterworks.  Elster/Amco Water meters do not meet specifications.
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