
No. CC090809-02 
 

BID SUMMARY 
September 8, 2009 

 
95. No. CC090809-02.1 – Sweeper Broom Refills for the Street Division (Opened September 2, 2009) 
            

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $30,000.00
   
 Sheehan Mack Sales & 

Equipment* 
Old Dominion Brush Co. Inc.* M-B Companies Inc.* 

 Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Item 1. Main Broom, Elgin 
Geo-Vac, 2 7/8” x 16” x 60” 

No Bid - $179.00 $1,074.00 $306.15 $1,836.90 

Item 2. Main Broom, 
Johnston 605 and 650, 5” 
x 15” x 52.5” 

$293.14 $7,035.36 $179.00 $4,296.00 $313.85 $7,532.40 

Item 3.  Johnston VT600 
Series, Two Piece Main 
Broom, 406mm x 646mm 

$312.16 $3,121.60 $280.00 $2,800.00 $313.85 $3,138.50 

Item 4. Gutter Broom Wire No Bid - $0.99 $9,900.00 $1.81 $18,100.00 
 
 
96. No. CC090809-02.2 - Enhanced Corrosion Inhibited Liquid Magnesium Chloride for Street Division (Opened September 2, 2009) 

 
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $32,000.00
 
 Unit Price Extended Price
1.  Smith Fertilizer & Grain Company Inc. $1.00 $10,000.00 
2.  *EnviroTech Services, Inc. $1.25 $12,500.00 

 
 
97. No. CC090809-02.3 – Founders Park Plaza (Opened September 2, 2009) 
  

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $80,000.00
 
 Unit Price Extended Price
1. *Scull Construction Service Inc. $103,400.00 $103,400.00 



98. No. CC090809-02.4 – West Main Street and Creek Drive Bridge Repairs Project No. SD09-1800 / CIP No. 50752 (Opened September 2, 
2009) 

 
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $50,000.00
 
  Total Bid 
1. *Stanley J. Johnsen Concrete Contractor Inc. $55,455.00 
2. *J.V. Bailey Co. Inc.   $34,395.00 
3. *SECO Construction, Inc.  $29,995.00 
4. *Corr Construction Services Inc.  $30,684.75 
5. *PCiRoads  $140,839.50 

 
 
 
 
* Bid Bond Enclosed 
**Cashier’s Check Enclosed 



 

BID AWARD SUMMARY 
 

LETTING DATE:  September 1, 2009 
 
 

 PROJECT: Sweeper Broom Refills  
 
 
 RECOMMENDATION:  Award Total Bid in the amount of $18,070.00 to Old 

Dominion Brush Company, Inc. at the September 8, 2009, Council Meeting. 
 
 
 

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY 
 
 
CONTRACTOR                                           

  
TOTAL BID 

Old Dominion Brush Company, Inc. $18,070.00 
M-B Companies, Inc. $30,607.80 
Sheehan Mack Sales & Equipment $10,156.96* 
 
*Did not include a bid for all items. 
 
 
City staff recommends awarding this product to Old Dominion Brush Company, Inc. for a total 
bid amount of $18,070.00 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation: 
 
 

FUNDING SOURCE TOTAL   Streets   

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $30,000.00   $30,000.00   

ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $30,000.00   $30,000.00   

FUNDING SOURCE 

APPROPRIATION DATA: 

TOTAL   Streets   

COST CENTER    0401   

LINE ITEM    4253   

FUNDING CENTER    0101   

BID AMOUNT $18,070.00   $18,070.00   
 
 

 

 
Date:  September 3, 2009 



BID TABULATION FOR: Sweeper Broom Refills 
Bid Open:  September 1, 2009
Department: Street Division Page 1

Item
No. Description Quantity City Estimate Sioux Falls SD Kansas City MO New Holstein WI

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1
Main Broom, Eglin Geo-Vac, 2 7/8" 
X 16" X 60", per each 6 179.00$          1,074.00$       306.15$          1,836.90$       

2
Main Broom, Johnston 605 and 650, 
5" X 15" X 52.5", per each 24 293.14$          7,035.36$       179.00$          4,296.00$       313.85$          7,532.40$       

3
Johnson VT600 Series, Two Piece 
Main Broom, 406mm X 646mm 10 312.16$          3,121.60$       280.00$          2,800.00$       313.85$          3,138.50$       

4 Gutter Broom Wire, per lbs. 10,000 0.99$              9,900.00$       1.81$              18,100.00$     
Totals 10,156.96$     18,070.00$     30,607.80$     

Sheehan Mack Old Dominion Brush Co M-B Companies

No Bid

No Bid



 

BID AWARD SUMMARY 
 

LETTING DATE:  September 1, 2009 
 
 

 PROJECT: Liquid Road Deicer – Enhanced Liquid Magnesium Chloride  
 
 
 RECOMMENDATION:  Award Total Bid in the amount of $12,500.00 to 

EnviroTech Services, Inc. at the September 8, 2009, Council Meeting. 
 
 
 

BIDDERS’ SUMMARY 
 
 
CONTRACTOR                                     QTY            UNIT PRICE  

  
TOTAL BID 

EnviroTech Services, Inc.                    10,000               $1.25                        $12,500.00 
Smith Fertilizer & Grain Co Inc.           10,000               $1.00                        $10,000.00* 
 
 
*Does not meet required specifications. 
 
 
City staff recommends awarding this product to EnviroTech Services, Inc. for a total bid amount 
of $12,500.00 based on unit pricing with the following appropriation: 
 
 

FUNDING SOURCE TOTAL   Streets   

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $32,000.00   $32,000.00   

ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE $32,000.00   $32,000.00   

FUNDING SOURCE 

APPROPRIATION DATA: 

TOTAL   Streets   

COST CENTER    0302   

LINE ITEM    4264   

FUNDING CENTER    0101   

BID AMOUNT $12,500.00   $12,500.00   
 
 

 

 
Date:  September 3, 2009 



BID TABULATION FOR: Enhanced Corrosion Inhibited Magnesium Chloride
Bid Open:  September 1, 2009
Department: Streets Division Page 1

Item
No. Description Quantity City Estimate Greeley CO Knoxville IA

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price

1
Enhanced Corrosion Inhibited 
Magnesium Chloride delivered as 
per specifications (Per Ton) 10,000 1.25$                12,500.00$  1.00$              10,000.00$     

Note:  Low bidder Smith Fertilizer & 
Grain Co product does not meet 
required specifications.

EnviroTech Services Inc. Smith Fertilizer & Grain Co Inc.
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