
No. CC081709-02 
 

BID SUMMARY 
August 17, 2009 

 
59. No. CC081709-02.1 – Milo Barber Transportation Center Improvements (Opened on August 11, 2009) 

            
ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $1,620,000.00 
  
 Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate C1 Alternate E1 
*Rangel Construction Co. LLC $903,000.00 $7,851.00 $62,247.00 $8,121.00 No Bid 
*Heavy Constructors Inc. $885,000.00 $16,000.00 $104,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid 
*MAC Construction Co. Inc. $888,000.00 $17,300.00 $63,800.00 $4,676.00 No Bid 
*SECO Construction Inc. $859,895.00 $14,800.00 $48,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid 
      

 
 

60. No. CC081709-02.2 – Elm Avenue Reconstruction – Phase 3; Project ST09-1759 / CIP 50130 (Opened on August 11, 2009) 
 

ADVERTISING AUTHORITY $1,700,000.00 
ENGINEERS ESTIMATE $1,789,819.22 
  
 Base Bid 
1.  *Simon Contractors of SD, Inc, $1,734,111.72 
2.  *Heavy Constructors $1,598,970.72 
3.  *Mainline Contracting, Inc. $1,765,609.20 
4.  *Hills Materials Company $2,085,703.31 
  

 
 
  
* Bid Bond Enclosed 
**Cashier’s Check Enclosed 
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