BiD SUMMARY

JUuLY 2, 2007

1) College Park Playground Project (opened June 20, 2007)

Advertising Authority $
Engineer’s Estimate $
ALTERNATES
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Supervise Sitework / Boulder, Deduct from
Base Bid MFR’s Rep | Curb Sitework / bid if
Installation Curb awarded
Installation Mallow Park
* All Decked Out, Inc. $90,949.50 | $4,315.00 $15,750.83 | $5,508.93 No Bid
* Midwest TLC, Inc. dba $104,947.00 | ($1,000.00) | $3,272.00 $14,398.00 | ($2,300.00)
Sterling West
* Miracle Recreation Design, $73,412.00 | $1,200.00 /| $25,000.00 | $25,000.00 | No Bid
Inc. c/o Crouch Recreation day
* Dakota Fence $85,168.00 | Inc base bid | $10,926.00 | $20,650.00 | ($1,000.00)
* Corner Construction $92,100.00 | $2,500.00 $20,400.00 | $33,100.00 | ($2,000.00)
* Game Time c/o Premier $56,004.00 | $1,500.00 $20,385.00 | $19,430.00 | No Bid
Recreation Products
2) Scott Mallow Park Playground Project (opened June 20, 2007)
Advertising Authority $
Engineer’s Estimate $
ALTERNATES
(1) (2) (3) (4)
Supervise Sitework / Boulder, Deduct from
Base Bid MFR’s Rep | Curb Sitework / bid if
Installation Curb awarded
Installation | College
Park
* All Decked Out, Inc. $64,911.50 | $2,215.00 $14,376.82 | $2,800.00 No Bid
* Midwest TLC, Inc. dba $68,023.00 | No Bid $4,058.00 $18,567.00 | See College
Sterling West Park
* Dakota Fence $59,050.00 | Inc base bid | $9,650.00 $20,462.00 | ($1,000.00)
* Corner Construction $61,030.00 | $2,500.00 $18,800.00 | $30,700.00 | ($2,000.00)
* Game Time c/o Premier $38,191.00 | $1,500.00 $23,280.00 | $21,265.00 | No Bid
Recreation Products
3) 20’ Litter Control Fence for Solid Waste Landfill (opened June 26, 2007)
Advertising Authority $52,000.00
1. * Ace Golf Netting LP $42,000.00




4)

BiD SUMMARY
JUuLY 2, 2007

Fork Life for Water Reclamation Division (opened June 26, 2007
Advertising Authority
1. * Anderson Forklift, Inc.

2. * Lift Pro Equipment Co., Inc.
3. * Butler Machinery Company

* BiD BOND SUBMITTED

$28,000.00

$22,594.00
$22,490.00
$24,170.00



