BID SUMMARY
NOVEMBER 6, 2006

1) Fire Shelters and Training / Practice Shelters for Rapid City Department of Fire &

Emergency Services (opened October 16, 2006)

Advertising Authority $
Fire Shelter,  Fire Shelter, Training / Training /
Complete, Complete, Practice Practice
M2002, Large, Shelter, Shelters,
per each M2002, Complete, Complete,
(Approx. 65) per each M2002, Large,
(Approx. 35) per each M2002,
(Approx. 6) per each
(Approx. 4)
Cascade Fire Equipment $19,175.00 $12,250.00 $738.00 $560.00
Medford, OR
Dakota Fire Supply $19,825.00 $11,725.00 $570.00 $580.00
Rapid City, SD
The Mallory Co. $17,485.00 $11,585.00 $1,180.00 No Bid
Longview, WA
Black Hills Fiberglass & $16,510.65 $10,251.85 $590.88 $539.84
Plastics
Rapid City, SD
Clarey’s Safety Equipment ~ $20,700.55 $5,344.15 $1,339.40 $390.33
Rochester, MN (10) (Freight)
M & T Fire & Safety, Inc. $19,825.00 $12,180.00 No Bid $544.00

Volga, SD

Rushmore Plaza Civic Center Multipurpose Addition — Bid Package 2 Project No. IDP06-
1555 (opened October 31, 2006)

Advertising Authority:
Engineer’s Estimate:

1. * Gustafson Builders

$15,200,000.00
$16,816,773.00

$22,750,000.00

Bid Alternate #1 Add $46,000.00
Bid Alternate #2 Add $14,500.00
Bid Alternate #3 Add $20,000.00
Bid Alternate #4 Add $588,000.00
Bid Alternate #5 Add $5,000.00
Bid Alternate #6 Add $100,000.00
Bid Alternate #7 No Bid
Bid Alternate #8 No Bid

2. * Sampson Construction Co., Inc. $25,100,000.00
Bid Alternate #1 Add $44,000.00
Bid Alternate #2 Add $38,000.00



3)

New Cold Water Meters for Water Department (opened October 31, 2006)

1.

ltem
No.

10

11

12

BID SUMMARY

NOVEMBER 6, 2006

Bid Alternate #3
Bid Alternate #4
Bid Alternate #5
Bid Alternate #6
Bid Alternate #7
Bid Alternate #8

* Sioux Pipe Inc.

Description
% Positive Displacement Oscillating Piston
Type Cold Water Meters, Meeting AWWA
Standards, Per Each
1” Positive Displacement Oscillating Piston
Type Cold Water Meters, Meeting AWWA
Standards, Per Each
1-1/2” Sealed Register Type Cold Water
Meters, Meeting AWWA Standards, Per
Each
2” Sealed Register Type Cold Water
Meters, Meeting AWWA Standards, Per
Each
3” Compound Cold Water Meters, Meeting
AWWA Standards, Per Each
4” Compound Cold Water Meters, Meeting
AWWA Standards, Per Each
1-1/2” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters,
Meeting AWWA Standards, Per Each
2” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters,
Meeting AWWA Standards, Per Each
3” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters,
Meeting AWWA Standards, Per Each
4” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters,
Meeting AWWA Standards, Per Each
6” Turbine Type Cold Water Meters,
Meeting AWWA Standards, Per Each
Remote Touch Pad Equipment, Per
Detailed Specifications, Per Each

250

100

20

20

20

20

439

Add  $19,000.00
Add $405,000.00
Add $5,000.00

Quantity  Unit Price

$118.50

$ 149.50

$ 331.00

$ 468.70
$1,600.00
$2,609.00
$475.00
$ 563.00
$ 773.00
$1,395.00
$2,860.00

$9.50

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Extended
Price

$29,625.00

$14,950.00

$ 6,620.00

$9,374.00
$ 3,200.00
$5,218.00
$ 9,500.00
$11,260.00
$ 1,546.00
$ 2,790.00
$ 2,860.00

$4,170.50

Bus Bench Advertising for Rapid Transit Division (Opened November 1, 2006)

1.

* Lamar Advertising of South Dakota Inc.

Description
Bus Benches Quantities
Jan 1 — Dec 31, 2007 125
Jan 1 — Dec 31, 2008 125

2

Unit Price Annual

Per Year Amount
$75 $9,375
$75 $9,375



BID SUMMARY
NOVEMBER 6, 2006

Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2009 125 $75
Jan 1 —Dec 31, 2010 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2011 125 $100
Total Bid Price:
Optional Bid
Description Unit Price
Bus Benches Quantities Per Year
Jan 1 — Dec 31, 2007 125 $100
Jan 1 — Dec 31, 2008 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2009 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2010 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2011 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2012 125 $100
Jan 1 —Dec 31, 2013 125 $100
Jan 1 - Dec 31, 2014 125 $100
Jan 1 -Dec 31, 2015 125 $125
Jan 1 —Dec 31, 2016 125 $125

Total Bid Price:

* BID BOND SUBMITTED

$9,375

$12,500
$12,500
$53,125

Annual

Amount
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$12,500
$15,625
$15,625
$131,250



