
BID SUMMARY 
 

 
Oxygen and Acetylene for Various City Departments 

 
 Lindweld A & B Welding 

 per CF per Tank per CF per Tank 
PRICE OF GAS 
1)  Small Oxygen Tank (approximately 122 cf) 

 
$0.073 

 
$8.91 

 
$0.055 

 
$8.47 

2)  Large Oxygen Tank  (approximately 244 cf) $0.049 $11.96 $0.045 $11.21 
3)  Small Acetylene Tank (approximately 100 cf) $0.16 $16.00 $0.17 $23.80 
4)  Large Acetylene Tank (approximately 300 cf) $0.16 $48.00 $0.14 $42.56 
TANK PURCHASE PRICE 
5)  Filled Oxygen Tank (approximately 80 cf) 

 
$0.087 

 
$6.96 

 
$0.08 

 
$6.64 

6)  Empty Oxygen Tank (approximately 80 cf) No Bid $140.00 No Bid $148.00 
7)  Filled Acetylene Tank (approximately 60ccf) $0.16 $9.60 $0.24 $14.40 
8)  Empty Acetylene Tank (approximately 60 cf) No Bid $110.00 No Bid $143.00 
9)  ADDITIONAL CYLINDER, 
per month charge (For any cylinder needed by 
the City that is not currently owned or leased) 

  
 

$1.00 

  
 

$3.50 
 
 
 

No. PW032702-05 


